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The authors of oral literature in the Pashtun language create their work at a far remove from any books.
Generally deprived of the support of schools and universities, their compositions are inseparable from song.
Their poetry is never declaimed; rather, their rhyme and rhythm have melodic value.

These popular improvisations do not exalt mystic love. In them there is no aspiration whatsoever to an
unfathomable and incommunicable heaven, nor devotion to the lord, nor praise for an absolute master, nor
any Adonis. To the contrary, they are songs of the earth. They celebrate nature, mountains, rivers, dawn and
night’s magnetic space. They are songs of war and honor, shame and love, beauty and death.

The repression of Afghan women has caused untold suffering, particularly through moral subjugation. Infant
daughters and their mothers are received with scorn and shame, and lead lives of subordination and
humiliation. Their rebellion against these tribal codes comes only through suicide and song.

Translated from the Pashtun into French by the eminent Sayd Bahodine Majrouh, the greatest Afghan poet of
the twentieth century, his text has been rendered into English in the expert hands of Marjolijn de Jager of the
Translation Department at NYU.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Ramos:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book called Songs of Love
and War: Afghan Women's Poetry? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can
spend your time with the favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you
have some other opinion?

Bryan Perry:

The book Songs of Love and War: Afghan Women's Poetry make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You
can utilize to make your capable much more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting
tension or having big problem with your subject. If you can make studying a book Songs of Love and War:
Afghan Women's Poetry for being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your own
capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You may know everything if you like
open and read a publication Songs of Love and War: Afghan Women's Poetry. Kinds of book are a lot of. It
means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Maria Kim:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get lot of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, often the book
you have read will be Songs of Love and War: Afghan Women's Poetry.

John Cheung:

Songs of Love and War: Afghan Women's Poetry can be one of your starter books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her
effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing Songs of Love and War: Afghan Women's Poetry
but doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource facts that
maybe you can be among it. This great information may drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial thinking.
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