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If it can happen in show business, it's happened to Jon Cryer. Now he's opening up for the first time
and sharing his behind-the-scenes stories in a warmly endearing, sharply observed, and frankly funny
look at life in Hollywood.

In 1986 Jon Cryer won over America as Molly Ringwald's loyal and lovable best friend, Duckie, in the cult
classic Pretty in Pink, in a role that set the tone for his three-decade-long career in Hollywood. He went on to
establish himself as one of the most talented comedic actors in the business, ultimately culminating in his
current turn as Alan Harper on the massively popular sitcom Two and a Half Men.

With the instincts of a natural storyteller, Cryer charts his extraordinary journey in show business,
illuminating his many triumphs and some missteps along the way. Filled with exclusive behind-the-scenes
anecdotes, Cryer offers his own endearing perspective on Hollywood, the business at large, and the art of
acting.

Cryer has worked with some of the biggest and most provocative names in the business, and here, for the
first time, he details his experiences with Charlie Sheen, John Hughes, Robert Altman, Molly Ringwald,
Demi Moore, Judd Nelson, and Christopher Reeve, among many others. He shares the intimate details of his
friendships and relationships, pays tribute to his mentors, and explores the peculiar combination of heart,
talent, and wisdom it takes to survive not just the bad times in a notoriously fickle industry but even the good
times.

In this revealing, humorous, and introspective memoir, Cryer offers listeners a front-row seat as he
reminisces about his life and experiences in showbiz over the past 30 years.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Williams:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of publication you read, if
you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want feel happy read one using theme
for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the So That Happened: A Memoir is kind of guide which
is giving the reader erratic experience.

Jeffrey Drake:

The guide untitled So That Happened: A Memoir is the guide that recommended to you to see. You can see
the quality of the publication content that will be shown to anyone. The language that publisher use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of study when
write the book, therefore the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also can get the
e-book of So That Happened: A Memoir from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Charles Edwards:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled So That Happened: A Memoir the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every
single aspect that maybe not known for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in
a publication then become one form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get prior to. The So
That Happened: A Memoir giving you an additional experience more than blown away your thoughts but
also giving you useful details for your better life within this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern
this is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning an activity.
Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Joseph Mack:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like So That Happened: A Memoir
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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